
Smith Wigglesworth: Only Believe

The Extraordinary Life of Smith Wigglesworth

Smith Wigglesworth was born in 1859 in Yorkshire, England, into a humble
family. His early life was marked by poverty and hardship, but he found
solace in his Christian faith.
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Despite his lack of formal education, Wigglesworth developed a deep
understanding of the Bible and a strong belief in the power of prayer. In
1907, he experienced a profound spiritual awakening that led him to
become a Pentecostal minister.

Wigglesworth quickly gained recognition for his remarkable faith and
healing abilities. He traveled extensively, preaching and conducting healing
services that drew thousands of people. He believed that faith was the key
to unlocking the healing power of God and that anyone could be healed if
they only believed.
The Teachings of Smith Wigglesworth

Wigglesworth's teachings emphasized the importance of faith, prayer, and
the Holy Spirit. He believed that faith was not just a mental assent to
certain beliefs, but a living, active force that could bring about miracles.

He taught that prayer was essential for connecting with God and releasing
His healing power. He encouraged people to pray boldly and persistently,
believing that God would answer their prayers.

Wigglesworth also emphasized the role of the Holy Spirit in healing. He
believed that the Holy Spirit was the power behind healing and that He
would work through those who were filled with His presence.

The Legacy of Smith Wigglesworth

Smith Wigglesworth passed away in 1947, but his legacy continues to
inspire millions worldwide. His teachings on faith, prayer, and healing have
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had a profound impact on the Pentecostal movement and the wider
Christian community.

Wigglesworth's example of unwavering faith and miraculous healings has
challenged many to believe in the power of God and to trust Him for the
impossible. His life and teachings serve as a testament to the extraordinary
things that can happen when we dare to believe.
Only Believe: The Book That Changed Lives

One of the most impactful ways to experience the life and teachings of
Smith Wigglesworth is through his book, "Only Believe." This book, written
by his daughter-in-law, contains a comprehensive account of
Wigglesworth's life and ministry.

Through vivid anecdotes and heartwarming stories, "Only Believe" reveals
the depth of Wigglesworth's faith, the power of his healing ministry, and the
challenges he faced along the way.

Reading "Only Believe" is an invitation to step into the world of Smith
Wigglesworth and to be inspired by his extraordinary journey of faith. It is a
book that will ignite your faith, strengthen your prayers, and empower you
to believe for the impossible.

Smith Wigglesworth was a man of unwavering faith who dedicated his life
to preaching the gospel and healing the sick. His teachings and legacy
continue to inspire millions worldwide, challenging them to believe in the
power of God and to trust Him for the impossible.

If you are longing for a deeper faith, a stronger prayer life, and a personal
encounter with the healing power of God, then I encourage you to delve



into the life and teachings of Smith Wigglesworth. And may the words of his
book, "Only Believe," ignite your spirit and empower you to live a life of faith
and purpose.
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